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PREAMBLE 
 
The Salaries and Allowances Act 1975 requires the Tribunal, at intervals of not more 
than twelve months, to enquire into and determine the remuneration to be paid or 
provided to Ministers of the Crown, the Parliamentary Secretary to the Cabinet, a 
Parliamentary Secretary appointed under Section 44A(1) of the Constitution Acts 
Amendment Act 1899, a Chairman, Deputy Chairman or member of a standing or joint 
standing committee, Officers and Members of the Parliament (MPs).  
 
In its August 2006 determination for Members of Parliament, the Tribunal abolished a 
$6,950 payment which had previously been paid to certain office holders in lieu of a 
second vehicle. This allowance had generally become regarded by Members as de 
facto compensatory remuneration for an office held. Remuneration for Parliamentary 
Secretaries and Chairmen of committees had also been the subject of regular annual 
submissions to the Tribunal. Additional remuneration for Parliamentary Secretaries 
was prohibited by statute. Legal advice to the Tribunal indicated that, although it had 
authority to determine additional remuneration for committee members, it was unable 
to differentiate between the remuneration for Chairmen, Deputy Chairmen and 
members. 
 
Following the release by the Tribunal of its August 2006 determination, the 
Government introduced into the Parliament the Parliamentary Legislation 
Amendment Bill 2006 to remove the statutory barrier regarding remuneration of 
Parliamentary Secretaries and to require the Tribunal to enquire into and determine 
the additional remuneration, if any, to be paid to Parliamentary Secretaries and 
Chairmen of standing committees. During the debate on the Bill in the Legislative 
Assembly, it was amended to require the Tribunal to consider the matter of additional 
remuneration to all members of standing and joint standing committees, including 
Chairmen and Deputy Chairmen.  The Bill received Royal Assent on 16 November 
2006. 
 
CURRENT ENQUIRY 
 
The Tribunal researched the work undertaken by committee members and 
Parliamentary Secretaries in the contemporary Parliament through a desk-study and 
through meetings with the President of the Legislative Council, the Speaker of the 
Legislative Assembly, the Leader of the Opposition, Parliamentary Secretaries, the 
Acting Clerk of the Legislative Council and the Clerk of the Legislative Assembly, an 
expert observer of the Western Australian Parliament, and a cross section of 
Chairmen of committees and committee members in a focus group format. Written 
submissions from the public were invited through an advertisement in 
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was not in a position to assess or quantify, the levels of the responsibility inherent in 
each of the roles of Chairman, Deputy Chairman and member of any committee were 
similar. Accordingly, the Tribunal came to the conclusion that level of responsibility 
was the most meaningful principle on which to base remuneration considerations. 
 
CONCLUSIONS 

 
Parliamentary Secretaries 
 
The responsibilities of Parliamentary Secretaries have been canvassed earlier in this 
determination. These are restricted by statute and hence are less than those of 
Ministers. However, they have responsible roles in the passage of legislation and 
representation of Ministers. Based on the evidence examined, the Tribunal has 
determined the additional remuneration for a Parliamentary Secretary to be 15 percent 
of the base Parliamentary salary. 
 
Committee Chairmen, Deputy Chairmen and members 
 
The Tribunal has become convinced that, for the committee system to be effective, all 
those involved in a committee must participate actively at all stages of the committee 
process. It determined that, in light of the differential levels of responsibility assumed, 
a Chairman should be remunerated at a higher level than a Deputy Chairman or 
members and that a Deputy Chairman warrants a small remuneration increase above 
members. Chairmen are to receive additional remuneration of 10 percent of the base 
Parliamentary salary; Deputy Chairmen 7.5 percent and members 7 percent. 
 
Multiple Entitlements 
 
Where a Member of Parliament serves in some capacity on more than one committee 
or is in receipt of any other additional remuneration for an office held, the Member, 
by this determination, is entitled to only one amount of additional remuneration, that 
being the highest. 
 
DETERMINATION 
 
The Tribunal has determined that the expense of office allowance of $1,822 available 
to Parliamentary Secretaries is hereby abolished. 
 
The Tribunal has also determined that the additional remuneration to be paid to a 
Parliamentary Secretary, a Chairman, a Deputy Chairman and a member of a standing 
committee is to be as follows, with immediate effect.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Office held Percent of base 
remuneration  

Additional 
remuneration 

Parliamentary 
Secretary 

15 $17,768 

Chairman of a 
standing committee  

10 $11,845 

Deputy Chairman 
of a standing 
committee 

7.5 $8,884 

Member of a 
standing committee 



The determination will now issue. 
 
Signed this 28th day of March 2007 
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